RFB 17-19APR21 - SWAT Helmets

Bid Tabulation Kiesler Police Supply Dana Safety Supply ABM Supply, LLC Ed Roehr Safety Products | ServPro of Marshall, Sedalia,
Columbia

Jeffersonville, IN Greensboro, FL Lenexa, KS St. Louis, Mo Columbia, Mo

4.10.1 SWAT Helmet - meets all

requirements stated herein including N1J

0106.01 Level 1liA, Black or Tan 641.30 737.00 665.00 | $ 1,268.29 No Bid

Sizes S-L

4.10.2 SWAT Helmet —meets all

requirements stated herein including NIJ

0106.01 Level IlIA, Black or Tan 667.80 768.80 695.00 | $ 1,268.29 No Bid

Size: XL

4.1.0.3 Retrofit face-shield/visor with rail

adapters made of clear polycarbonate a

minimum 6”in height/length by 8” in

width and .150” rated N1J-0104.02 or 100.70 114.70 110.00 | $ 109.76 No Bid

better, fragmentation MIL STD 662F V50

rated

4.10.4 SWAT Helmet Gas Mask Strap for

the SWAT Helmet bid for line item 4.10.1 13.50 15.50 15.00 | $ 10.29 No Bid

and 4.10.2.

Renewal Option 1 3% 0% 59, 3% No Bid

Renewal Option 2 0% 3% 5% 39 No Bid

Renewal Option 3 0% 3% 5% 3% No Bid

Co-Op No Yes Yes Yes No Bid




